
 
 

 

 
Freedom of Information Request Reference No: FOI 002848-20 
 
I write in connection with your request for information received by Suffolk Constabulary on the 20 
August 2020 in which you sought access to the following information: 
 
1. “The total number of Community Protection Notices issued per year.  
2. The number of Community Protection Notice Warnings issued which mention suicide, self-

harm or a mental health condition, or mental health units or treatment.  
3. The number of full Community Protection Notices issued which mention the issues specified 

above.  
4. The number of people issued with a CPN or CPNW following a mental health episode, 

including episodes of police involvement under Section 135 or 136 of the Mental Health Act  
5. Any guidelines or internal assessments of the use of CPN and CPNW with regard to mental 

health patients.” 
 
Response to your Request 
 
The response provided below is correct as of 3 September 2020 
 
Suffolk Constabulary has considered your request for information and the response is below.    
 
The Constabulary is unable to establish the number of occasions a Community Protection Notice 
(CPN) was served mentioning suicide, self-harm or mental health conditions. The information is 
not recorded in a searchable format and each CPN would need to be reviewed individually to 
extract this information.  
 
Centrally, there are a total of 132 CPNs recorded on the Constabulary’s crime system. There is a 
degree of inconsistencies in the recording of CPNs and therefore there may well be additional 
records not accounted for in this figure. In addition, the figure does not account for occasions a 
CPN was issued and the individual no longer lives in the Constabulary force area, meaning 
Suffolk is no longer the managing force.  
 
The local Safer Neighbourhood Teams have been consulted and they do not maintain a central 
record of CPNs issued. Therefore, to ensure a precise response is provided, the Constabulary 
would be required to review the 132 CPNs recorded on the crime system and interrogate other 
document including emails and pocket notebooks, to extract the total number issued and then of 
those, the number that relate in some way to suicide, self-harm or mental health.  
 
In relation to your request for information and in accordance with Section 17 of the Freedom of 
Information Act 2000 (FOIA), this response serves as a formal notification of refusal for your 



 
 

 

request. Suffolk Constabulary does not hold, for the purposes of FOIA, the information you 
require in a retrievable format. 
 
It is estimated that to attempt to retrieve all of the information you require would take a 
considerable amount of retrieval time, which would exceed 18 hours. This would exceed the 
appropriate limit for dealing with Freedom of Information requests, in terms of costs and therefore 
Section 12(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 applies. 
 
Section 12(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 states that a Public Authority is not obliged 
to: “…comply with a request for information if the authority estimates that the cost of complying 
with the request would exceed the appropriate limit.”  The Freedom of Information (Appropriate 
Limit and Fees) Regulations, defines the ‘appropriate limit’ for the Suffolk Constabulary as £450 
and specifies that this sum equates to 18 hours work at a standard rate of £25 per hour. 
 
In accordance with Section 17(5) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000, this letter serves as a 
refusal notice for this part of your request. 
 
By requesting all information your request is too broad to be complied with within the £450 limit 
imposed on Freedom of Information requests.   
 
Although excess cost removes the Force’s obligations under the Freedom of Information Act, as 
a gesture of goodwill, I have supplied information, relative to your request, retrieved or available 
before it was realised that the fees limit would be exceeded. I trust this is helpful, but it does not 
affect our legal right to rely on the fees regulations for the remainder of your request.  
 
CPN action process 
 
Individuals (or businesses) who come to Police notice for continuing or persistent unreasonable 
behaviour, which has a detrimental effect and harms the community and their quality of life, are 
considered for a variety of preventative and remedial options. 
 
One of these options involves the Community Protection Notice legislation which aims to address 
such behaviour. This is a 2-step approach using a warning (alongside other interventions or 
support identified) as a method to encourage a change in the subject’s behaviour, following by a 
full Community Protection Notice if the conduct and detrimental effect continues. 
 
The subject person is researched on Police data bases to help build a picture of that person’s 
behaviour, the harm being caused and also the demand created. This includes our crime 
recording and management system, incident reporting system and intelligence.  
 
Affected communities may also be canvassed to understand the impact upon them as this cannot 



 
 

 

always be qualified by our systems. 
 
Consideration is giving to securing additional witness statements at this point as part of the 
evidential process. 
 
By now the Police have a better understanding of the community being harmed, the type of harm 
being caused, the demand being created and also an understanding of the subject causing the 
harm. 
 
Consideration is given as to whether to consult with other identified partners such as 
District/Borough Councils, Housing, Support Workers, Social Care and Mental Health Services. 
This consideration is important when dealing with persons experiencing Mental Health issues and 
Trauma. Police will work with partners to determine whether other methods of intervention and 
support for the subject are more suitable and viable and whether the CPN route is appropriate for 
that individual.  
 
By taking into account all these factors an assessment is made as to whether the criteria are met, 
namely whether the conduct of an individual or business is having a continuing or persistent 
detrimental effect of the quality of life of those in the locality, and if this behaviour is 
unreasonable.  We will also consider whether action under CPN legislation is appropriate given 
any surrounding circumstances. 
 
If the criteria are met a CPN Warning will be issued under S43(5) of the Anti-social behaviour, 
Crime and Policing Act 2014. The warning clearly identifies the behaviour that is required to 
change and outlines the consequences of failing to do so in terms of proceeding to a CPN notice 
and ultimately legal proceedings and potential criminal conviction if not addressed. The CPN can 
require the subject to stop, or do specified things (Such as self-refer to Turning Point or Housing), 
and take reasonable steps to achieve specified results. 
 
Consideration will also take place as to whether a support worker or representative from partner 
agencies should be present when the CPN warning is served, and consultation will be sought 
regarding this if needed. 
 
Relevant Police systems are updated to capture the CPN Warning being issued to the subject 
and any relevant partners may be updated accordingly. This is a preventative intervention and is 
also part of the evidential process. It is not enforceable at the CPN Warning stage. 
 
If the behaviour persists further evidence is gathered as per step 1. Further research and 
assessment are conducted again to quantify the behaviour, impact and suitability for a CPN 
Notice to be issued. Consultation with relevant partners is once again considered as above. 
 



 
 

 

If this application relates to a subject experiencing Mental Health Issues or trauma again that 
consultation with Mental Health Services, Support Workers and Social care is vital. If the decision 
is made that a CPN is suitable and necessary then additional statements may be secured to 
support this action being taken. 
 
The Community Protection Notice will be issued under S43 of the Anti-social behaviour, Crime 
and Policing Act 2014. The requirements must be reasonable, and must be in order to prevent or 
reduce detrimental effect from continuing or recurring.  Consideration should again take place as 
to whether a support worker or representative from partner agencies should be present when the 
CPN is served. 
 
The CPN Notice is enforceable and legal proceedings can result from any breaches. It is 
important to note that the CPN Notice details an Appeals Procedure which explains how the 
subject can Appeal the CPN at a Magistrates Court. The Court are able to revoke, amend or 
uphold the CPN as a result. 
Should you have any further queries concerning this request, please contact Clair Pack, FOI 
Decision Maker, quoting the reference number shown above. 
 
A full copy of the Freedom of Information Act (2000) can be viewed on the ‘Office of Public Sector 

Information’ web-site; 
http://www.opsi.gov.uk/ 

 
Suffolk Constabulary is not responsible for the content, or the reliability, of the website 

referenced. The Constabulary cannot guarantee that this link will work all of the time, and we 
have no control over the availability of the linked pages. 



 
 

 

Your Right to Request a Review of Decisions Made Under the Terms of the  
Freedom of Information Act (2000). 

 
If you are unhappy with how your request has been handled, or if you think the decision is 
incorrect, you have the right to ask Suffolk Constabulary to review their decision. 
 

Ask Suffolk Constabulary to look at the decision again. 
 
If you are dissatisfied with the decision made by Suffolk Constabulary under the Freedom of 
Information Act (2000), regarding access to information, you must notify Suffolk Constabulary that 
you are requesting a review within 40 working days of the date of its response to your Freedom of 
Information request.  Requests for a review should be made in writing and addressed to: 
 

Freedom of Information Decision Maker 
Information Management Department 
Suffolk Constabulary 
Police Headquarters 
Martlesham Heath 
Ipswich 
Suffolk 
IP5 3QS 
OR 

    Email: information@suffolk.pnn.police.uk   
 
In all possible circumstances Suffolk Constabulary will aim to respond to your request for us to 
look at our decision again within 20 working days of receipt of your request for an internal review. 
 

The Information Commissioner. 
 
After lodging a request for a review with Suffolk Constabulary, if you are still dissatisfied with the 
decision, you can apply to the Information Commissioner for a decision on whether the request 
for information has been dealt with in accordance with the requirements of the Act. 
 
For information on how to make application to the Information Commissioner please visit their 
website at www.ico.org.uk or contact them at the address shown below: 
 

The Information Commissioner’s Office 
Wycliffe House 
Water Lane 
Wilmslow 
Cheshire 
SK9 5AF 
Telephone: 01625 545 700 

 
 
 


