
 
 

 

 
Freedom of Information Request Reference No: FOI 001975-20 
 
I write in connection with your request for information received by Suffolk Constabulary on the 10 
June 2020 in which you sought access to the following information: 
 
1. “The total number of reported hate-crimes in your Constabulary each year from January 1st 

2000 to June 1st 2020 
 
2. From those cases above, how many resulted in a conviction? 
 
3. Out of these hate-crimes, do you have statistics on how many were incidents of racism? If 

so, can this figure be included for each month?” 
 
Response to your Request 
 
The response provided below is correct as of 18 June 2020 
 
Suffolk Constabulary has considered your request for information and the response is below.    
 
A search has been completed for all hate crimes recorded by the Constabulary to date. Please 
note that the information is only held from 2003 onwards.  
 
As a result in a change to crime recording system during October 2015, the information has been 
presented in two separate tables as the data from the two separate crime systems are not 
recorded in a consistent manner and cannot be used for comparative purposes.  
 
Please note that information concerning conviction information is not recorded by the 
Constabulary. We have therefore supplied crime outcomes as an alternative.  
 

Year  Detected Pending Undetected Total 

2003 219  254 473 

2004 210  259 469 

2005 171  282 453 

2006 203 2 253 458 

2007 178  355 533 

2008 236  372 608 

2009 239  603 842 

2010 250  576 826 



 
 

 

2011 195  579 774 

2012 165  470 635 

2013 142  423 565 

2014 133  513 646 

2015 78 7 397 482 

Total 2,419 9 5,336 7,764 

 

Detected = Types 1 to 8 (Positive Outcome) 

Undetected = Types 9 to 22 (Negative Outcome) 

Pending = Not Recorded 

 

Outcome 2015 2016 2017 2018 2019 2020 Total 

Not Recorded 3 20 31 29 18 53 154 

Type 1 - Charged/Summonsed/Postal Requisition 21 85 100 123 93 25 447 
Type 10 - Formal Action Against Offender is not in the 
Public Interest (Police) 

 5 20 7 17 7 56 

Type 11 - Prosecution Prevented-Named Suspect 
Identified But Is Below The Age Of Criminal Responsibility 

 8 3 4 6  21 

Type 12 - Prosecution Prevented-Named Suspect 
Identified But Is Too Ill (Physical Or Mental Health) To 
Prosecute 

2 17 17 7 15 4 62 

Type 14 - Evidential Difficulties Victim Based- Suspect 
Not Identified 

2 29 44 60 58 21 214 

Type 15 - Named Suspect Identified: Evidential Difficulties  22 127 222 295 246 94 1,006 

Type 16 - Named Suspect Identified: Evidential Difficulties  11 140 267 209 201 63 891 
Type 17 - Prosecution Time Limit Expired: Suspect 
Identified But Prosecution Time Limit Has Expired 

 1 4 6 3  14 

Type 18 - Investigation Complete; No Suspect Identified.  19 174 282 248 176 76 975 

Type 1A - Charged/Summons - alternate offence.   9 17 10 5 3 44 

Type 2 - Caution Youth  9 6 6 10 1 32 
Type 20 - Further action resulting from the crime report 
will be undertaken by another body or agency  

 19 30 19 20 4 92 

Type 21 - Not in the public interest - police decision.  20 13 8   41 
Type 22 - Diversionary, educational or intervention 
activity, resulting from the crime report, has been 
undertaken and it is not in the public interest to take any 
further action. 

    8 1 9 

Type 2A - Caution Youth - alternate offence.    1  1  2 

Type 3 - Caution Adult 1 12 12 9 8 5 47 

Type 3A - Caution Adult - alternate offence.   2 2 2   6 



 
 

 

Type 4 - TIC - Taken into Consideration    13   13 

Type 5 - Offender has died  1     1 

Type 6 - Penalty notice for disorder  3 1 2 3 1 10 

Type 8 - Community resolution (Crime) 1 42 46 31 21 5 146 

Type 9 - Prosecution Not In the Public Interest (CPS) 4 1 2 1   8 

Grand Total 86 724 1,120 1,089 909 363 4,291 

 
The number of the above offences that have a racial marker, are as follows: 
 

Year  Racist Hate Crimes 

2003 409 

2004 394 

2005 389 

2006 380 

2007 445 

2008 446 

2009 537 

2010 538 

2011 460 

2012 402 

2013 361 

2014 443 

2015 365 

2016 447 

2017 543 

2018 596 

2019 538 

2020 222 

Grand Total 7,915 

 
Towards the end of 2017 Supt. Kerry Cutler was asked to take the thematic lead for Hate Crime.  
Since this time significant progress has been achieved in co-ordinating a Suffolk wide approach 
to hate crime working jointly with Suffolk County Council. This has resulted in a joint continuous 
improvement plan and developments in key partnership areas to ensure the work around hate 
crime is more joined up, informed by data and victim led. 
 
Our vision is to: Provide a quality service to victims, their families and the wider community.  



 
 

 

 
The plan has 3 key objectives: 

1) Raise awareness of hate crime. 
2) Encourage reporting. 
3) Prevent and challenge prejudices that lead to acts of hate crime. 

 
This plan encompasses the recommendations from the HMICFRS thematic 2018 report 
‘Understanding the difference- the initial police response to hate crime’. The plan focusses five 
key areas to tackle hate crime from beginning to end – from understanding the drivers of hate 
crime and dealing with its causes to providing improved support to victims: 
 
Governance, Leadership and Accountability:  
To provide system wide strategic support to a multi-agency Hate Crime Network (HCN) and 
ensure there is co-ordination and communication between stakeholders within the system. This 
section also includes an action to monitor the adherence to the victim’s code of practice by 
Suffolk Police. 
 
Preventing Hate Crime 
Actions within this section reflect the importance of preventing hate crime happening in the first 
place. It looks at the role the wider partnership arena, such as CSPs, Schools and front line 
officers, can play to prevent and challenge those attitudes that can lead to discrimination and 
divisions within society. It also gives direction towards cyber related hate incidences to better 
understand the levels and response.  
 
Increasing knowledge 
Through a closer working relationship between Suffolk County Council, Suffolk Police and the 
wider Hate Crime Network we have the ability to draw upon a wide range of data (police recorded 
hate crime and non-police reported incidences) and expertise to better understand the drivers of 
hate crime and how it can be addressed. Enhancing the ability to flag incidences of hate crime on 
Athena will allow better direction of resources and prevalence of incidences.  
 
Increasing reporting and improving support  
In order to respond to victim’s we need to ensure that we make the process of reporting crimes 
and incidents is as easy as possible, whether that’s through the police or other reporting 
mechanisms. The ambition for Suffolk is to have third party reporting through a wide range of 
partners, enabling victims to have the ability to report and receive support at the same time.  
Work needs to be done to encourage reporting from groups who may under-report, such as 
disabled people, Muslim women and new refugee communities. 
 
Norfolk and Suffolk Victim Care (previously known as Victim Support) have been commissioned 
by the Police Crime Commissioner to offer emotional and practical support to victims of Hate 



 
 

 

Crime. The service is free and confidential, referrals can be made by the Police, partner agencies 
and self-referral. They play an active part in the network.  
 
We will also look to work effectively with perpetrators, working with youth offending and through 
the principles of restorative justice where appropriate.  
 
We will also look to publicise good news stories to increase victim’s confidence to report.  
 
Improve the quality of investigations 
This section is mainly led by Suffolk Police but will be supported by the wider system where 
appropriate and supports the overall vision. Using internal scrutiny processes (Appendix two) for 
Suffolk Police we can work on the quality of investigations and ensure a better approach to 
dealing with the criminal proceedings for hate crime offenders and support to victims. Most 
recently a HMICFS report identified ways in which the initial police response to victims could be 
improved, sharing best practice to ensure a consistent approach is given to victims.  
 
Should you have any further queries concerning this request, please contact Clair Pack, FOI 
Decision Maker, quoting the reference number shown above. 
 
A full copy of the Freedom of Information Act (2000) can be viewed on the ‘Office of Public Sector 

Information’ web-site; 
http://www.opsi.gov.uk/ 

 
Suffolk Constabulary is not responsible for the content, or the reliability, of the website 

referenced. The Constabulary cannot guarantee that this link will work all of the time, and we 
have no control over the availability of the linked pages. 



 
 

 

Your Right to Request a Review of Decisions Made Under the Terms of the  
Freedom of Information Act (2000). 

 
If you are unhappy with how your request has been handled, or if you think the decision is 
incorrect, you have the right to ask Suffolk Constabulary to review their decision. 
 

Ask Suffolk Constabulary to look at the decision again. 
 
If you are dissatisfied with the decision made by Suffolk Constabulary under the Freedom of 
Information Act (2000), regarding access to information, you must notify Suffolk Constabulary that 
you are requesting a review within 40 working days of the date of its response to your Freedom of 
Information request.  Requests for a review should be made in writing and addressed to: 
 

Freedom of Information Decision Maker 
Information Management Department 
Suffolk Constabulary 
Police Headquarters 
Martlesham Heath 
Ipswich 
Suffolk 
IP5 3QS 
OR 

    Email: information@suffolk.pnn.police.uk   
 
In all possible circumstances Suffolk Constabulary will aim to respond to your request for us to 
look at our decision again within 20 working days of receipt of your request for an internal review. 
 

The Information Commissioner. 
 
After lodging a request for a review with Suffolk Constabulary, if you are still dissatisfied with the 
decision, you can apply to the Information Commissioner for a decision on whether the request 
for information has been dealt with in accordance with the requirements of the Act. 
 
For information on how to make application to the Information Commissioner please visit their 
website at www.ico.org.uk or contact them at the address shown below: 
 

The Information Commissioner’s Office 
Wycliffe House 
Water Lane 
Wilmslow 
Cheshire 
SK9 5AF 
Telephone: 01625 545 700 

 
 
 


