
 

 
 

 

 
Freedom of Information Request Reference N o: FOI 002540-18 
 
I write in connection with your request for information received by Norfolk and Suffolk 
Constabularies on the 18 July 2018 in which you sought access to the following information: 
 
“Under the terms of the Freedom of Information Act 2000, please provide me with full details of 
your force’s expenditure on attendance at the following Chief Constables’ Councils meetings: 
  
11-12 July 2018, London 
  
18-19 April 2018, York 
  
24 –25 January 2018, Police Federation HQ, Surrey 
  
18 –19 October 2017, Guildhall, London 
  
12 –13 July 2017, Latimer Place, Buckinghamshire 
  
5 – 6 April 2017, Radisson Blu, Durham 
  
25 –26 January 2017 Police Federation HQ, Surrey 
  
For each meeting, please state: 
  
a. How many of your chief officers and any support staff attended 
b. How much money was spent on their accommodation, and at what hotel 
c. How much money was spent on their travel to the venue, and whether it was train/car/flight 
d. How much money was spent on their food and drink during the trip” 

 
Response to your Request 
 
The response provided below is correct as of 10 August 2018 
 
Norfolk and Suffolk Constabularies have considered your request for information and our response 
is below.    
 
In respect the number of chief officers and staff who attended the Chief Constables’ Councils 
meetings (CCC), this information is provided below, including costs incurred by those individuals. 
The location of the hotel accommodation, where recorded, has not been included as a result of 
exemptions within the Act.  
 



*Total costs include the total course cost, which will also include accommodation and subsistence. 
This is owing to the costs not generally being recorded separately.  
 
Norfolk 
 

DATE How many 
attended 

Means of 
travel 

Cost of 
Travel Total Cost* 

25-26 Jan 2017 CC  Car  £0 £284 

5-6 Apr 2017 CC  Car £0 £345.27 

12-13 Jul 2017 CC  Car Not recorded £297 

18-19 Oct 2017 No Chief Officer in attendance** 

24-25 Jan 2018 No Chief Officer in attendance** 

18-19 Apr 2018 CC Car £0 £420.36 

11-12 July 2018 No Chief Officer in attendance** 

**Where no Norfolk Chief Officer attended the meetings, the Suffolk Chief Constable attended and 
represented both Norfolk and Suffolk Constabularies.  
 
Suffolk 
 

DATE How many 
attended 

Means of 
travel 

Cost of 
travel Total Cost 

25-26 Jan 2017 CC Car Not recorded £234 

5-6 Apr 2017 CC Car Not recorded £321 

12-13 Jul 2017 CC Car Not recorded £310.20 

18-19 Oct 2017 CC Train 84.70 £103 

24-25 Jan 2018 CC Car Not recorded £167 

18-19 Apr 2018 CC + Chief Supt Car Not recorded £224 

11-12 July 2018 CC Train 87.70 £419.97 

 
With respect to the locations of the hotels the Chief Officers stayed at, this has been withheld as a 
result of exemptions within the Act.   
 
Section 1 of the Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 2000 places two duties on public authorities. 
Unless exemptions apply, the first duty at s1(1)(a) is to confirm or deny whether the information 
specified in a request is held. The second duty at s1 (1)(b) is to disclose information that has been 
confirmed as being held.  
 
Where exemptions are relied upon s17 of FOIA requires that we provide the applicant with a notice 
which:  
 

a) States that fact,  
b) Specifies the exemption(s) in question and  
c) States (if that would not otherwise be apparent) why the exemption applies 

 



The Constabularies can confirm that the information is held, however specific information has been 
redacted from the statements. This information is exempt from disclosure by virtue of the following 
exemption: 
 
Section 24(1)   – National Security 
Section 31(1)(a-c)  – Law Enforcement 
Section 38(1)   – Health and Safety 
 
Sections 24, 31 and 38 are qualified and prejudice based exemptions and I am therefore obliged to 
consider the public interest.  
 
Harm 
 
Although there is a call for openness and transparency, this needs to be balanced against the 
harm in disclosure of the requested information. The Police Service has a clear responsibility to 
prevent and detect crime and disorder and to protect the communities we serve.  
 
The prevention and detection of crime is the foundation upon which policing is built and the threat 
from terrorism cannot be ignored. It is generally recognised in this current environment that the 
international security landscape is increasingly complex and unpredictable. The current UK threat 
level from international terrorism, based on intelligence, is assessed as ‘severe’ which means that 
a terrorist attack is highly likely. https://www.mi5.gov.uk/threat-levels 
  
There has been evidence in the past of terrorist using information to formulate a planned attack on 
points of distinct vulnerability. The information resources they use to gather such includes that 
disclosed under FOI, media requests and physical investigation, all of which assist in the 
formulation of a picture which reveal areas of susceptibility.  
 
The prevention and detection of crime is the foundation upon which policing is built and the police 
have a clear responsibility to prevent crime, arrest those responsible for committing crime or those 
who plan to commit crime.  However, there is also a duty of care to the public at large.  The UK 
Police Service has a positive undertaking to protect the public from harm and that duty of care to 
all involved, must be the overriding consideration. 
 
To provide the location of the Chief Constables Councils meetings and the relevant hotel to which 
they stayed would identify strategic locations assigned for these meetings. The meetings represent 
the senior operational decision-making body for the NPCC and in attendance will be Chief 
Constables from all police forces, including the BTP, MOD and includes representatives from the 
CNC and NCA etc.   
 
To confirm the locations of such meetings will pose a risk to the safety of those persons present as 
criminals may target these locations. As much as it can be argued that the information can be 
viewed as historic, the locations of these meetings will invariably be the same in the future. 
Therefore any disclosure of the locations of hotels etc will also identify where the meetings are 
likely to take place.  
 



It is for the reasons stated above that the exemptions at Sections 24, 31 and 38 are applied.  
 
Public Interest Test 
 
Section 24  
 
Factors favouring disclosure 
 
The provision of information pertaining to national security, would lead to a better informed public 
and therefore assure more accurate public debate.   
 
A fundamental purpose of FOI is the knowledge of how public funds are allocated to ensure the 
police service is held to account. The public are entitled to know how public funds are utilised and 
that the counties chief officers are effectively engaging with national matters of importance.  
 
Factors favouring non-disclosure 
 
The personal safety of the public is inextricably linked to national security and any information that 
could identify vulnerabilities would not be disclosed. Information regarding the location of the hotels 
at which the chief officers stayed would provide those intent of committing such acts of terrorism 
with specific information, thus compromising the safety of those concerned. This would clearly 
hinder the Constabularies effectiveness to enforce the law and place risk on National Security.  
 
Section 31  
 
Factors favouring disclosure 
 
Disclosure of this information would enable the public to know whether the Constabularies Chief 
Officers are attending such meetings in order to address future challenges. This in turn would 
increase confidence by providing the public with reassurances that the Constabularies continue to 
discuss strategic and tactical options going forward. 
 
Factors favouring non-disclosure 
 
The disclosure of sensitive information such as hotel locations will provide the criminal fraternity of 
the CCCs movements and locations. The meetings are designed to address strategic intentions, 
operational planning and tactical options and disclosure of the locations would allow criminals to 
map potential locations in the future, making them vulnerable to repercussion.  
 
The personal safety of the public and Constabulary employees is inextricably linked to national 
security and any information that could place chief officers at risk would not be disclosed. The 
Constabularies have a responsibility to ensure safety of individuals is protected at all times.  
 
Section 38  
 
Factors favouring disclosure 
 



The release of information would provide an insight into the Police Service and enable the public to 
have better understanding of its effectiveness. The public would be informed and be able to 
participate in accurate public debate. 
 
Factors favouring non-disclosure 
 
The release of information will identify future CCC locations, which may have a detrimental impact 
on the meetings and those whom attend. Such a disclosure would impact the efficient and effective 
conduct of service should employees consider their safety is compromised.   
 
Balance Test 
 
There is a public interest in the transparency of Chief Officer’s attendance at meetings and the 
costs incurred as a consequence. It is also recognised that there is a strong public interest in 
knowing that the CCC has due regard to the delivery of effective, appropriate and balanced law 
enforcement. A fundamental aspect of the FOI is to ensure the public are aware of how resources 
are distributed and effectively managed; provision of the information will ensure this public 
confidence is maintained.  
 
As much as there is a public interest in knowing that the delivery of law enforcement is appropriate 
and balanced, this will only be overridden in exceptional circumstances.  The safety of the public 
and Constabulary employees is of paramount importance and any information which would place 
individuals at risk and compromise the National Security of the United Kingdom, no matter how 
generic, is not in the public interest. The effective delivery of operational law enforcement is crucial 
and of paramount importance to Constabularies. Any disclosure would have a negative impact on 
law enforcement.  
 
The constabularies consider that the public interest has been fulfilled by the disclosure of the 
remaining information requested as it is invariably the costs incurred by the Constabularies and the 
knowledge that the Constabularies are regularly represented at these meetings, which hold the 
most weight from a public interest perspective.   
 
Therefore it is our opinion that for these reasons the balance test for disclosure is not made out for 
the location of the hotels.  
 
Should you have any further queries concerning this request, please contact Clair Pack, FOI 
Decision Maker, quoting the reference number shown above. 
 
A full copy of the Freedom of Information Act (2000) can be viewed on the ‘Office of Public Sector 

Information’ web-site; 
http://www.opsi.gov.uk/ 

 
Norfolk and Suffolk Constabularies are not responsible for the content, or the reliability, of the 

website referenced. The Constabulary cannot guarantee that this link will work all of the time, and 
we have no control over the availability of the linked pages. 



Your Right to Request a Review of Decisions Made Under the Terms of the  
Freedom of Information Act (2000). 

 
If you are unhappy with how your request has been handled, or if you think the decision is 
incorrect, you have the right to ask the Norfolk and Suffolk Constabulary to review their decision. 
 

Ask Norfolk and Suffolk Constabularies to look at the decision again. 
 
If you are dissatisfied with the decision made by Norfolk and Suffolk Constabularies under the 
Freedom of Information Act (2000), regarding access to information, you must notify the Norfolk 
and Suffolk Constabulary that you are requesting a review within 20 days of the date of its 
response to your Freedom of Information request.  Requests for a review should be made in 
writing and addressed to: 
 

Freedom of Information Decision Maker 
Information Management Department 
Suffolk Constabulary 
Police Headquarters 
Martlesham Heath 
Ipswich 
Suffolk 
IP5 3QS 
OR 

    Email: information@suffolk.pnn.police.uk   
 
In all possible circumstances Norfolk and Suffolk Constabulary will aim to respond to your request 
for us to look at our decision again within 20 working days of receipt of your request for an internal 
review. 
 

The Information Commissioner. 
 
After lodging a request for a review with Norfolk and Suffolk Constabulary, if you are still 
dissatisfied with the decision, you can apply to the Information Commissioner for a decision on 
whether the request for information has been dealt with in accordance with the requirements of the 
Act. 
 
For information on how to make application to the Information Commissioner please visit their 
website at www.ico.org.uk or contact them at the address shown below: 
 

The Information Commissioner’s Office 
Wycliffe House 
Water Lane 
Wilmslow 
Cheshire 
SK9 5AF 
Telephone: 01625 545 700 

 
 
 


