

**Freedom of Information Request Reference N°: FOI 000756-18**

I write in connection with your request for information received by Suffolk Constabulary on the 22 February 2018 in which you sought access to the following information:

- “1. The number of reports of bicycle thefts.*
- a. Please include any details of the model / price of bike*
  - b. Please also highlight the number of cases, if any that mention "Strava", "Facebook", "twitter" "Instagram" or "fitness tracker app".*

*Could I please have the data for the past three years, starting with the most up-to-date data.*

*Could you please sort the data by year”*

**Response to your Request**

The response provided below is correct as of 8 March 2018.

Suffolk Constabulary has considered your request for information and the response is below.

A search was carried out on our crime information systems CIS and Athena in relation to bicycle theft, each case was researched to provide the manufactures name which is provided in the below table broken down by year.

We can confirm that none of the below mentioned "Strava", "Facebook", "twitter" "Instagram" or "fitness tracker app".

<b>Manufacturer</b>	<b>2015</b>	<b>2016</b>	<b>2017</b>	<b>2018</b>	<b>Total</b>
AARDVARK	1				1
ALPOLLO	3				3
AMMACO	7				7
Apollo	52	63	38	6	159
APPOLLO	21				21
Atlas			1		1
B.M.K.	1				1
Barracuda	7	7			14
Bianchi	4	4	11		19
BMC			3		3



Bmx	3	16	9	2	30
Boardman	12		38	10	60
Bosch			2		2
Boss	2	1	1	1	5
BRITISH EAGLE	1				1
Brompton			6		6
Cannondale	16	13	29	2	60
Canyon			1		1
Carraro		1		1	2
CARREA	20				20
Carrera	130	169	236	30	565
Carrera technologies			1		1
CHALLENGE	1				1
CHALLENGER	1				1
CHARGER	1				1
Claud butler	42	45	56	6	149
CONDOR	1				1
CROSS	3				3
Cube	6		10		16
Dawes	21	8	14	3	46
Decathlon			1		1
DIAMOND BACK	15				15
Diamondback	1	11	14	2	28
Dunlop	6	1	1		8
ELSWICK	3				3
EMMELLE	4				4
EXPLORER	1				1
FALCON	8				8
Felt	7	3	10		20
Focus	4	1			5
FORME	3				3
FOX	2				2
Fuji	3	1	1		5
G.T.	9				9
Gary fisher			2		2



**SUFFOLK  
CONSTABULARY**  
*Taking pride in keeping Suffolk safe*

Genesis	1	3	2	2	8
Giant	63	78	101	6	248
GSR	1				1
Gt	6	21	24	1	52
HALFORDS	3				3
Hard		1			1
HARLEM	1				1
HARROW	1				1
HAWK	1				1
HERCULES	1				1
HOLDSWORTH	1				1
Honda			1		1
IDEAL	1				1
Jamis	1		2		3
Kawasaki		1			1
Kona	7	9	6		22
KUDOS	1				1
LANDROVER	1				1
Limit			1		1
M.B.K.	2				2
Magna	1	1	1		3
Marin	4	3	4		11
MAYFAIR	1				1
MERCURY	4				4
Merida	9	7	23		39
Merlin/rock lobster			1		1
Mongoose	15	2	5	2	24
MOUNTAIN RIDGE	1				1
MUDDY FOX	11				11
Muddyfox	2	17	14	1	34
Norco		2	1		3
Not Recorded	541	1063	1043	113	2760
OHIO	1				1
On-one				3	3
Optima		5	1		6



SUFFOLK  
CONSTABULARY

*Taking pride in keeping Suffolk safe*

Orbea	4		2	1	7
PASHLEY	1				1
Peugeot	4	6	2	1	13
Pinnacle			2		2
Pioneer			1		1
PLANET	1				1
Planet x		3	1		4
PRO AM	1				1
PROBIKE	9				9
PROFESSIONAL	1				1
RAGAZZIE	1				1
Raleigh	67	71	62	1	201
Reebok	2	2	2	1	7
REFLEX	3				3
Ridgeback	9	8	12	1	30
Rocky mountian		2			2
Saracen	6	10	7	3	26
Schwinn	4	4	1	1	10
SCORPION	1				1
Scott	23	22	29	3	77
SHIMANO	2				2
Shockwave			1		1
SHOGUN	2				2
SILVER FOX	1				1
Specialized	56	49	83	6	194
SPECIALIZEDS	1				1
STOLEN BMX	15				15
Storck			2		2
SUPER FOX	1				1
SWINN	1				1
Titan			4		4
TOWNSEND	4				4
TRACK STAR	1				1
TRACKERXG	3				3
Trax	9	1	5		15



Trek	17	43	33	4	97
TRIUMPH	1				1
Umbro	1				1
Universal	1	1	2		4
VERTICAL	1				1
Viking	3	8	8	1	20
Voodoo cycles	2	14	22	5	43
WE ARE THE PEOP	3				3
Whyte		5	1		6
Wilier		6			6
X-RATED	6				6
Yeti			1		1
<b>Grand Total</b>	<b>1372</b>	<b>1812</b>	<b>1998</b>	<b>219</b>	<b>5401</b>

The following table refers to the number of bikes stolen, along with the price bracket that has been recorded on our system, broken down by year.

<b>Estimated value £</b>	<b>2015</b>	<b>2016</b>	<b>2017</b>	<b>2018</b>	<b>Total</b>
0-100	459	627	619	64	1769
1000+	55	108	141	11	315
101-200	276	332	340	39	987
201-300	208	247	296	39	790
301-400	134	179	199	20	532
401-500	84	100	176	21	381
501-600	52	72	63	10	197
601-700	31	44	50	5	130
701-800	31	41	38	1	111
801-900	15	19	28	1	63
901-1000	23	34	46	8	111
\$1200			1		1
\$700			1		1
Unknown		7			7
£30/£50		2			2
Not recorded	4				4
<b>Grand Total</b>	<b>1372</b>	<b>1812</b>	<b>1998</b>	<b>219</b>	<b>5401</b>



***Police forces in the United Kingdom are routinely required to provide crime statistics to government bodies and the recording criteria is set nationally. However, the systems used for recording these figures are not generic, nor are the procedures used locally in capturing the crime data. It should be noted that for these reasons this force's response to your questions should not be used for comparison purposes with any other response you may receive.***

***Please be aware that the information provided/researched from the 19 October 2015 has been extracted from the Athena crime system. The information provided is subject to change as processes are amended to ensure accurate and precise crime recording.***

A full copy of the Freedom of Information Act (2000) can be viewed on the 'Office of Public Sector Information' web-site;  
<http://www.opsi.gov.uk/>

Suffolk Constabulary is not responsible for the content, or the reliability, of the website referenced. The Constabulary cannot guarantee that this link will work all of the time, and we have no control over the availability of the linked pages.



Your Right to Request a Review of Decisions Made Under the Terms of the  
Freedom of Information Act (2000).

If you are unhappy with how your request has been handled, or if you think the decision is incorrect, you have the right to ask Suffolk Constabulary to review their decision.

Ask Suffolk Constabulary to look at the decision again.

If you are dissatisfied with the decision made by Suffolk Constabulary under the Freedom of Information Act (2000), regarding access to information, you must notify Suffolk Constabulary that you are requesting a review within 20 days of the date of its response to your Freedom of Information request. Requests for a review should be made in writing and addressed to:

*Freedom of Information Decision Maker  
Information Management Department  
Suffolk Constabulary  
Police Headquarters  
Martlesham Heath  
Ipswich  
Suffolk  
IP5 3QS  
OR  
Email: [information@suffolk.pnn.police.uk](mailto:information@suffolk.pnn.police.uk)*

In all possible circumstances Suffolk Constabulary will aim to respond to your request for us to look at our decision again within 20 working days of receipt of your request for an internal review.

The Information Commissioner.

After lodging a request for a review with Suffolk Constabulary, if you are still dissatisfied with the decision, you can apply to the Information Commissioner for a decision on whether the request for information has been dealt with in accordance with the requirements of the Act.

For information on how to make application to the Information Commissioner please visit their website at [www.ico.org.uk](http://www.ico.org.uk) or contact them at the address shown below:

The Information Commissioner's Office  
Wycliffe House  
Water Lane  
Wilmslow  
Cheshire  
SK9 5AF  
Telephone: 01625 545 700