
 
 
 
Freedom of Information Request Reference No: FOI 002640-18 
 
I write in connection with your request for information received by Suffolk Constabulary on the 25 
July 2018 in which you sought access to the following information: 
 
“This is in regards to your guidance for safeguarding children and vulnerable adults that your 
organisation and staff must follow.  
 
Incidents and Discipline: 
 
1. Have you had a reported incident regarding staff not following your safeguarding guidance in 

the last three years?  
2. If so, how many?  
3. How many legal actions have been taken against you due to staff not following safeguarding 

guidance?  
4. Has anyone been disciplined or fired due to staff not following safeguarding guidance in the 

last three years?  
 
Training: 
 
5. How often do you undertake any education or training around safeguarding guidance?  
 
Updating and Dissemination: 
 
6. How often are safeguarding guidance standards updated? 
7. When was the last complete review of your safeguarding guidance?  
 
Storage and accessibility: 
 
8. In what format and programme do you hold your safeguarding guidance?  
9. In what format and programme do staff access this guidance?  
10. Can you access safeguarding guidance on mobile devices?   
11. If so, can this guidance be accessed while offline? 
 
Audit and Review: 
 
12. Can your workforce audit their compliance to central standards regarding safeguarding 

guidelines and so identify any shortfalls?  
13. Do you have the capability to audit delivery standards against current safeguarding 

guidance? 



 
 
 
Quantitative measures:  
 
14. How many pages of safeguarding guidance does your organisation have? 
 
Response to your Request 
 
The response provided below is correct as of 1 August 2018 
 
Suffolk Constabulary has considered your request for information and the response is below.    
 
In relation to your request for information and in accordance with Section 17 of the Freedom of 
Information Act 2000 (FOIA), this response serves as a formal notification of refusal for your 
request. Suffolk Constabulary does not hold, for the purposes of FOIA, the information you 
require in a retrievable format. 
 
It is estimated that to attempt to retrieve all of the information you require would take a 
considerable amount of retrieval time, which would exceed 18 hours. This would exceed the 
appropriate limit for dealing with Freedom of Information requests, in terms of costs and therefore 
Section 12(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 applies. 
 
In relation to Questions 1 -4, safeguarding covers a multitude of different policies and procedures 
relating to many different areas. We do not record allegations in such a way that would purely 
relate to safeguarding issues. 
 
The most likely allegation category that a complaint of this nature would be recorded under is 
“Other neglect of failure in duty”, during the requested three year period there have been a total 
of 695 allegations of “Other neglect”. To retrieve the data for questions 1 – 4 would require a 
manual case read of each complaint to establish if it related to not following safeguarding 
guidance. Based on a 5 minute search of each case, this would take in the region of 58 hours to 
retrieve, way exceeding the statutory time restraints of the FOI Act. 
 
In addition, whilst the category of “Other neglect of failure in duty” is most likely, there may be 
complaints of this nature that are recorded under different complaint headings, such as “Duties 
and responsibilities” which again would involve manually searching through complaint records. 
 
Section 12(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 states that a Public Authority is not obliged 
to: “…comply with a request for information if the authority estimates that the cost of complying 
with the request would exceed the appropriate limit.”  The Freedom of Information (Appropriate 
Limit and Fees) Regulations, defines the ‘appropriate limit’ for the Suffolk Constabulary as £450 
and specifies that this sum equates to 18 hours work at a standard rate of £25 per hour. 



 
 
 
In accordance with Section 17(5) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000, this letter serves as a 
refusal notice for this part of your request. 
 
By requesting all information your request is too broad to be complied with within the £450 limit 
imposed on Freedom of Information requests.   
 
Although excess cost removes the Force’s obligations under the Freedom of Information Act, as 
a gesture of goodwill, I have supplied information, relative to your request, retrieved or available 
before it was realised that the fees limit would be exceeded. I trust this is helpful, but it does not 
affect our legal right to rely on the fees regulations for the remainder of your request.  
 
Safeguarding training is covered by various ways including: 
 
• Initial Police Learning and Development Programme on all officers joining and further 

dedicated days into interview training that will include sexual assault, code of ethics, missing 
persons, domestic abuse, first aid etc 

• Initial Crime Investigator’s Development Programme on all officers joining CID and further 
dedicated days into interviewing and achieving best evidence. 

• In addition, there are many specialist courses that comprehensively cover safeguarding: 
 

 Investigative Supervisors Development Programme, ISDP, (Detective Sergeant Course) 
Investigating Sudden Childhood Death, ISCD 
Management of Serious Crime Investigations Development Programme, MSCDP, (Detective 
Inspector Course) 
Management of Sexual Offenders and Violent Offenders, MSOVO 
Specialist Child Abuse Investigator’s Development Programme, SCAIDP 
Rape and Specialist Sexual Assault Investigator’s Course, RSSAI 
Investigative Interviewing for Serious and Complex Crime, IISCC  

 
Updating and Dissemination: 
 
Guidance is updated following national change, and policy is regularly reviewed and renewed 
following audit by the policy team. 
 
Storage and accessibility: 
 
Guidance is documents are held on the intranet systems with administrative support to add new 
and remove old documents dependent on need. 
 
 



 
 
A full copy of the Freedom of Information Act (2000) can be viewed on the ‘Office of Public Sector 

Information’ web-site; 
http://www.opsi.gov.uk/ 

 
Suffolk Constabulary is not responsible for the content, or the reliability, of the website 

referenced. The Constabulary cannot guarantee that this link will work all of the time, and we 
have no control over the availability of the linked pages. 



 
 

Your Right to Request a Review of Decisions Made Under the Terms of the  
Freedom of Information Act (2000). 

 
If you are unhappy with how your request has been handled, or if you think the decision is 
incorrect, you have the right to ask Suffolk Constabulary to review their decision. 
 

Ask Suffolk Constabulary to look at the decision again. 
 
If you are dissatisfied with the decision made by Suffolk Constabulary under the Freedom of 
Information Act (2000), regarding access to information, you must notify Suffolk Constabulary that 
you are requesting a review within 20 days of the date of its response to your Freedom of 
Information request.  Requests for a review should be made in writing and addressed to: 
 

Freedom of Information Decision Maker 
Information Management Department 
Suffolk Constabulary 
Police Headquarters 
Martlesham Heath 
Ipswich 
Suffolk 
IP5 3QS 
OR 

    Email: information@suffolk.pnn.police.uk   
 
In all possible circumstances Suffolk Constabulary will aim to respond to your request for us to 
look at our decision again within 20 working days of receipt of your request for an internal review. 
 

The Information Commissioner. 
 
After lodging a request for a review with Suffolk Constabulary, if you are still dissatisfied with the 
decision, you can apply to the Information Commissioner for a decision on whether the request 
for information has been dealt with in accordance with the requirements of the Act. 
 
For information on how to make application to the Information Commissioner please visit their 
website at www.ico.org.uk or contact them at the address shown below: 
 

The Information Commissioner’s Office 
Wycliffe House 
Water Lane 
Wilmslow 
Cheshire 
SK9 5AF 
Telephone: 01625 545 700 

 
 
 


